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LIST OF CONTRACTS AWARDED

FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY TO DECEMBER 2019

APPROVED BUDGET FOR DATE OF
NAME OF PROJECT THE CONTRACT | PARTICIPATING BIDDERS BID AMOUNT WINNING BIDDER pg?::ﬁ::nqp::'r D‘“E;: PRE | cummission& | DATEOFAwWARD
i3] OPENING OF BIDS
1[SUPPLY & DELIVERY OF » Filzack Industries » Lot 1: P11,350,000.00
BRAND NEW WOVEN Packaging Corporation Lot 2: #7,352,000.00
POLYPROPYLENE 50-KG
CAPACITY EMPTY SACKS AT = ® Sencar Industrial P Lot 1: #11,450,000.00 ;
1M PCS. FOR RICE AND :g éj :1336%?10500?00 Corporation Lot 2: $7,584,000.00 Hilck '23:‘“’::;:‘"35'“3 April8,2019 | April 22,2019 May 6, 2019 May 17, 2019
800,000 PCS. FOR PALAY AR e
REQUIREMENT OF NFA P Golden Portals Industry | #» Lot 1: P11,860,000.00
REGION 02 PROVINCES Inc. Lot 2 P7,952,000.00
2|PROCUREMENT FOR THE
SUPPLY & DELIVERY OF LOT 1: P623,280.00 LOT 1: P623,280.00
2019 PESTICIDE LOT 2: P62,790.00 Pycor Inc. LOT 2: P62,790.00 Pycor Inc, May 20, 2019 N/A June 3,2019 June 7, 2019
REQUIREMENT OF NFA LOT 3: P114,240.00 LOT 3: P114,240.00
REGION D2
3|REPAIR OF TYPHOON LOT 1: P1,000,000.00  [Lot1: Lot 1: ity
ROSITA (INFRASTRUCTURE » Proline Const. > PO89,176.67 b Proiliia Chiat:
DAMAGES) P Fragerr Const P PU98 046.13
LOT 2: #1,000,000.00  |Lot2: Lot 2: o
® Proline Const. > P088,331.70 e
B Fragerr Const B-POO7 91749
LOT 3: #1,000,000.00 Lot 3: Lot 3: Lot 3
» Proline Const. » P996,942.80 >R a‘gm it
P Fragerr Const - PO04 264.92
LOT 4: $1,260,645.00 Lot 4: Lot 4: ——
P Proline Const. »P1,253,947.91 > Prc:Hm 7 Lot 1: June 21,2019
LOT 5: #1,151,154.00 Lot 5: Lot 5: Lot 2: June 21,2019
P Proline Const. B P1,126,021.47 Lot 5: May 20, 2019 May 31, 2019 June 14, 2019 Lot 3: June 21, 2019
LOT &: P688,230.00 Lot 6: Lot 6: » Prc;“m i Lot 4; lune 21, 2019
» Proline Const. B P672,232.56 Lot 5: June 21,2019
P Fragerr Const. P P666,220.01 Lot 6 Lot 8: June 21,2019
» Buildtek Const. > P6B2,728.48 < m'gm_r o
LOT 7: PRO0,000.00 |Lot 7: Lot 7:
P Proline Const. B P796,106.09 Lot 7:
P Fragerr Const. ¥ P798,040.39 '
& i Gooet b P792,557.38 wBliatek Conat:
LOT 8: #1,200,000.00 Lot 8: Lot 8: ot
P Proline Const. »P741,133.74 > Profina Const
P Fragerr Const. P Withdrawn
» Buildtek Const. b P744,118.72




# Fil-Power Group and » Lot 1: #2,999,000.00 June 17, 2019 June 24, 2019
SUPPLY, DELIVERY & Marketing Corporation Lot 2: #1,499,000.00
COMMISSIONING OF LOT 1: P3,000,000.00 Fil-Power Group and
GENERATING SETS AT NFA |LOT 2: F1,500,000.00 » CP Parlay P Env. A Falled Marketing Corporation
SANTAGO CITY
SUPPLY, DELIVERY,
INSTALLATION, TEST AND  |LOT 1: P850,000.00 LOT 1: #830,000.00
COMMISSIONING OF LOT 2: P650,000.00 Agricomp Machineriesand |LOT 2: #630,000.00 Agricomp Machineries and i
BIOMASS FED FURNACES AT |LOT 3: P650,000.00 Construction Corporation  |LOT 3: P640,000.00 Construction Corporation W, 0k WA Jonsin, 2032 Juitba, $059
VARIOUS SITES OF NFA LOT 4; P850,000.00 LOT 4: #840,000.00
REGION 02
SUPPLY OF PARTS,
NECESSARY TOOLS AND
LABOR FOR THE REPAIR OF Agrisun Agricultural and AgriSun Agricultural and 9
BUIVANGGO RICEMLL AT P2,400,000.00 Mill Supply £2,400,000.00 Mill Supply May 23, 201 june 3, 2019 June 17,2019 June 20,2019
MATUCAY, ALLACAPAN,
CAGAYAN
SUPPLY OF PARTS,
T %lﬁse‘;:ﬁz oF |17 1:#2,000,00000 LOT 1: P1,962,480.00
LOT 2: $2,000,000.00 MechaPhil Corporation |LOT 2:#1,952,115.65 MechaPhil Corporation June 17, 2019 N/A June 21, 2019 June 21, 2019
SIPLBATAKE MIGEMUAAT 1) oo 5. 91:400/000.00 LOT 3: #1,389,605.24
VARIOUS SITES OF NFA - ) ’
REGION 02
2019 PRIVATE MILLING SERVICES
LOT 1: {P550,875.00) ) :
63% GMR LOT 1: 63% GMR
LOT 2: (P550,875.00) ]
63% GMR LOT 2: 63% GMR
LOT 3: (P550,875.00) ]
63% GMR LOT 3: 63% GMR
Lk t;gg;lg;iﬁol LOT 4: 63% GMR
NFA ALLACAPAN E Ravilas Ricemill E Ravilas Ricemill June 21,2019 July 1, 2019 July 17, 2019 August 2, 2019
LOT 5: (P550,875.00) LOTS: 63% GMR
63% GMR i
LOT 6: (P550,875.00) - &3% 0
63% GMR LOT6: 63% GMR
LOT7: (P550,875.00) ”
63% GMR LOT 7: 63% GMR
LOT8: (#550,875.00) .
63% GMR LOT 8: 83% GMR
LOT 9: (P550,875.00)
63% GMR
LOT 10: (P550,875.00)
63% GMR
LOT 11: (P550,875.00)
el KNC RICEMILL ENV. A FAILED
LOT 12: (P550,875.00)
NFA CAGAYAN SRl FOR REBIDDING
LOT 13; (P550,875.00) _
63% GMR
LOT 14: [P550,675.00)
63% GMR




LOT 15: (P550,875.00)
63% GMR

DIOSA RICEMILL NO BID SUBMITTED
LOT 16: (P550,875.00)
63% GMR
LOT 17: (P550,875.00) :
S ek LOT 17: 63.02% GMR
s [6';;%!::: a0 LOT 18: 63.02% GMR
B NFA KALINGA JGL RICEMILL JGL RICEMILL
ML AR IFSO0HTS A0 LOT 19: 63.02% GMR
63% GMR SO
LOT20: Es?g:"é':::‘m] LOT 20: 63.02% GMR June 21, 2019 July 1, 2019 July 17,2019 August 2, 2019
LOT 21: (P550,875.00) > Alheed Agro. Int'l. > 63.02% Family Choice Grains
63% GMR B Fam. Choice GPC »63.03% Processing Center
LOT 22: (P550,875.00) Family Choice Grains 62.03% Family Choice Grains
63% GMR Processing Center ' Processing Center
LOT 23: (P550,875.00)
gt HR Pascua GC & RM 63.00% HR Pascua GC & RM
LOT 24: (P550,875.00) » Eastern Grain Clr, Inc. > Env. A Failed
63% GMR » RS Grains RM » Late Submission FOR REBIDDING
LOT 25: (P550,875.00) Lucky ] 888 Ricemill _
g 2 Bovion No Bid Submitted FOR REBIDDING
» EV dela Cruz RM » Withdrawn
LOT26: (6’35::06‘:::'“0} » Good Sam MPC » 63.10% Good Samaritan MPC June 21, 2019 July 1, 2019 July 17, 2019 August 2, 2019
' » Lucky ] 888 Rm Corp. - No Bid Submitted
LOT 27: (P550,875.00) » EV dela Cruz RM > Withdrawn
63% GMR » Lucky | 888 Rm Corp. | » No Bid Submitted FRRRIHERING
P EV dela Cruz RM P Withdrawn
: (PS50, X
LOT 2% 55'30 /\%';17: 00) |y Lucky | 888 RM Corp. | » No Bid Submitted dela Cruz - Cadelitia RM June 21,2019 July 1,2019 July 17,2019 August2,2019
6 » dela Cruz-Cadelifa > 63.10%
P EV dela Cruz RM P Withdrawn
. =
LOT 2%: g;s;%i[?:m) » Lucky | 88BRM Corp. | ™ No Bid Submitted dela Cruz - Cadelifia RM June 21,2019 July 1, 2019 July 17, 2010 August 2, 2019
; ¥ dela Cruz-Cadelina P 63.10%
P EV dela Cruz RM P Withdrawn
LOT 38: %1;55%5:;-':.@ » Lucky | 888 RM Corp. | ™ No Bid Submitted dela Cruz - Cadelifia RM June 21,2019 July 1,2019 July 17,2019 August 2, 2019
i » dela Cruz-Cadelina > 63,10%
LOT 31: {P550,875.00) » Masagana Grains Ctr. » Env. A Failed
63% GMR » Lucky | 888 RM Corp. | ™ No Bid Submitted FORRERIEDING
LOT 32: (P550,875.00) » Masagana Grains Ctr. P Env. A Falled
63% GMR » Lucky | 888 RM Corp. | » No Bid Submitted M REHIDPIG
i » Masagana Grains Cir. » Env. A Falled
LOT 3% gﬁ;‘%ﬁ;’:m] » Lucky ] 888 RM Corp. | ™ No Bid Submitted FOR REBIDDING
; » FJC RM & Grains » No Bid Submitted
- » Masagana Grains Cir. P Env. A Failed
LOT33: gzs g:%i'?:m) » Lucky | 888 RM Corp. | > No Bid Submitted FOR REBIDDING
» FIC RM & Grains » No Bid Submitted
» Alheed Agro. Int’l. P 63.02%
34: (P550,875. .
LoT 23% é'::: 00) [y Lucky | 888 RM Corp. | ™ No Bid Submitted Alheed Agro Int'. Jure 21,2019 July 1,2019 July 17, 2019 August 2, 2019
» FJC RM & Grains P No Bid Submitted
LOT 35: (P550,875.00) | Alheed Agro. Int'. »6302% :
63% GMR » Lucky ) 888 RM Corp. » No Bid Submitted Alheed Agro In'. June 21,2019 July 1, 2019 July 17, 2019 August 2,2019
LOT 36: (P550,875.00) | » NIGM » No Bid Submitted
63% GMR P Eastern Grain Ctr, Inc. » Env. A Failed PORREMDDING




B.d

NFA ISABELA

63% GMR

LOT 37: g’g-’:;%ﬂh;’:-"m :’;Ef..f ?i:;l::”m Inc . g:f: :;Ezmd F;’;ﬁ:;:';gﬁ':ﬁ June 21,2039 July 1,2019 July 17,2019 August 2, 2019
P Family Choice GPC P 63.03%
LOT 38 L';ii'i;":f:m] :Il?ff k;ir:::; ::cc " : gﬁfﬁalu CGC Grains, Inc. June 21,2019 July 1, 2019 July 17,2019 August 2, 2019
LOT 39: (g;%‘::’:ml :Eﬁf k?’::::e‘:‘é " : ﬁfi"i‘w s CGC Grains, Inc. June 21,2019 July 1,2019 July 17, 2019 August 2, 2019
LOT 40: 2;5@2%,?17:.001 :ngk?r:ﬁ:;::é " : zﬁ-";ﬂw CGC Grains, Inc, June 21,2019 July 1,2019 July 17,2019 August 2, 2019
LOT41: 55;5;06":: bl Lucky Archer GPC Env. A Failed FOR REBIDDING
LOT 42: igi()cﬁns-ﬂtl} FF:,T{:KS‘;‘:?:E;"::* 63.03% Ff:;?&‘:g;ﬁ:’ june 21,2019 July 1, 2019 July 17,2019 August 2, 2019
LOT 43; Ll';zﬂc.i::’:m} Fiﬂzgif‘;n’::s 63.03% Fa;:’;?;;ﬁ;‘z:f;:’ June 21,2019 July 1,2019 July 17,2019 August 2,2019
S e Fmggiﬂ;n“::s 63.03% Fa;:’;'g;g;‘g;fﬂ':’ june21,2009 | July1,2019 | July17,2010 August 2, 2019
LOT 45: 2?9206,8;;-00} Fiﬂ:;ig:&:n":;'s 63.03% Fj,':‘;'c’;:;::jg‘z;’f::“ June 21,2019 July 1, 2019 July 17,2019 August 2,2019
LOT 46: E_'Pssozﬂc.ﬁ':ﬂﬁ} szg:::af::s 63.03% Fal,'r”;'c’;:;zggfn’zr’ june 21,2019 July 1, 2019 July 17, 2019 August 2,2019
LOT 47: {s?é:ﬂéi{?;m] REA G“{‘:';:i‘:‘r" Milling 63.00% REA Gr"‘f:’:;::rd M June 21,2019 July 1,2019 July 17, 2019 August 2,2019
LOT48: [6"35%506‘::;"“"] CGC Grains, Inc. 63.03% CGC Grains, Inc. June 21,2019 July 1, 2019 July 17,2019 August 2, 2019
LOT4%: 55'3502(’6‘;::‘“‘“ CGC Grains, Inc. 63.03% CGC Grains, Inc. June 21,2019 July 1, 2019 July 17, 2019 August 2,2019
LOT 50: 5525"2002:::00} CGC Grains, Inc. 63.03% CGC Grains, Inc. June 21, 2019 July 1, 2019 July 17, 2019 August 2,2019
LOT 52: g:;%ﬁ':m} CGC Grains, Inc. 63.03% CGC Grains, Inc. June 21,2019 July 1,2019 July 17, 2019 August 2, 2019
LOT 53: ggiz%ﬁ:ﬂﬂ] Isabela Gcg:::feld Grain No Bid Submitted FOR REBIDDING
LOT 54: (‘;5;0(;‘::‘:-00} :fjacé’r‘ud:_'::m;g e ::_ﬁ?‘g‘,’aﬁs“b’““md dela Cruz - Cadelffia RM June 21,2019 July 1,2019 July 17, 2019 August 2,2019
iyl A
N e
sl
TS (5,359:06;? o0 ; :aa;ti:;d;:af:zlgﬁnc iy ::;er;itted Good Samaritan MPC June 21, 2019 july 1, 2019 July 17,2019 August 2, 2019
»GoodSam. MPC___ |»63.10%
LOT 59: g?;%;?:m] : ::cmlfyclhg?; E;lccm- 2 :;g; Submitted F mxzs;&rﬁr’“ June 21, 2019 fuly 1,2019 July 17, 2019 August 2, 2019
LOT 60: (PY50,675.00) Lucky | 888 RM Corp. No Bid Submitted FOR REBIDDING
63% GMR
LOT61: Eirssq:uéa:::m} Lucky ] 899 RM Corp. No B Sibattiad FOR REBIDDING
LOT 62: i?;ﬂgi?:m) Lucky | 888 RM Corp. No Bid Submitted FOR REBIDDING
LOT 63: (P550,875.00) Lucky ] B8B RM Corp. No Bid Submitted FOR REBIDDING




LOT 64: (P550,875.00)

63% GMR Lucky | 888 RM Corp. No Bid Submitted FOR REBIDDING
LoTas: L?;"G":::"’“] Isabela Seed Growers MPC No Bid Submitted FOR REBIDDING
LOY:66: f;;'%ﬁ:‘w Isabela Seed Growers MPC No Bid Submitted FOR REBIDDING
LOT 67: (P550,875.00) HR Pascua Grains Center &
i ok 63.51% FOR REBIDDING
LOT 68: (P550,875.00) » HR Pascua GC & RM »6351% HR Pascua Grains Center &
63% GMR » R&A Grains & Milling Ctr. | » 63.10% Ricerill lupods, 2089 Inky 3, 2019 luly:A7,2019 Augut 2, 2019
LOT o g;séﬂéﬁ;-ﬂﬂ} RS Grains Ricernill Late Submission FOR REBIDDING
LOT 70 ggsgi%ﬁ:m] RS Grains Ricenill Late Submission FOR REBIDDING
71: (P550,87500)  |» 1 Corp. | » No Bid Submitted
T 553% g ;::Zd] f:fﬂ_"l‘:n_ . :;’03% TRista Alheed Agro Int'l. June 21, 2019 July 1,2019 July 17, 2019 August 2, 2019
72 (P550,87500) | W Luc | > No Bid Submitted
dd 553% il ) : Mh:: Ji:;"l‘n’tﬁj’"’ . 6;’;‘;% ibaitho Alheed Agro Int’. June 21,2019 July 1, 2019 July 17, 2019 August 2,2019
73: (P55087500)  |» L Corp. | » No Bid Submitt
LoT 5535%?:":{:“ Vo ;ﬁi‘:d' fsgzﬁ’:t,]_ & 530;‘"% HRiod Alheed Agro int'l June 21, 2019 July 1, 2019 July 17, 2019 August 2, 2019
74 (P550,875.00) | ® Lucky | 88 >N i
T 2;5% cﬁ:n ) 3 uu:::dl Agim’rﬁf"’ b :g:“"’"‘““"d Alheed Agro Int' June 21, 2019 July 1,2019 July 17, 2019 August 2, 2019
75: (P550,875] > > Env. A Falled
0T 5335;%":‘: " B é:::i:ﬁ;:: » . Eg‘_’zf;’“ St Catherine MPC June 21, 2019 July 1,2019 July 17, 2019 August 2, 2019
0.87500) _|® Marjophi > Env.
10T 7 {gg éfum I S:E‘:&er'lfg';’;c > Eg; f;"’d St Catherine MPC June 21, 2019 July 1,2019 July 17, 2019 August 2, 2019
Be | NFANUEVAVIZCAYA
LOT77: 255;%?::00] Masagana Ricemill Env. A Failed FOR REBIDDING
LOT78: (P550,875.00) | >NV Alay Kapwa MPC » Env. A Failed
63% GMR » Alfred Henson RM » Env. A Failed EOR REBIODING
79: (P550,875, R REA Grains and
i {63% e A c”‘gg‘t‘:‘f Ml 63.00% = Mitlng June 21, 2019 July 1, 2019 July 17, 2019 August 2, 2019
ar NFA IFUGAO
 (P550,875, REAG R&A Grains and MIll
(R, (63592 Gjrg.m - = rsélf,:f oRE 63.00% fac‘;z’r Milling June 21,2019 July 1,2019 July 17,2019 August 2, 2019
REPAIR OF FARMERS HALL
9 g:gg‘;;':éf’gﬁg} 1,200,000.00 Triple P Construction 1,200,000.00 Triple P Construction August2 2019 | August13,2019| August27,2019 | September6,2019
VIZCAYA
10 |RE-BIDDING OF LEFT OUT LOTS OF 2020 MILLING SERVICES
Lot 1: 63.00% KNC Ricemnill 63.00% KNC Ricemill
Lot 1: 63.00% KNG Ricemill 63.00% KNC Ricemill
- B KNC Ricemill P 63.00% .
Lot 3: 63.00% B Hastacn Grahy Conlor > 63.07% Eastern Grain Center, Inc.
) P KNC Ricemill P 63.00%
Lot 4: 63.00% » Lucky Archer GPC »63.07% Kaacky Archisr GPE
10.a NFA CAGAYAN B KNC Ricemill »63.00% A August2,2019 | August 13,2019 | August27,2019 | September 14,2019
Lot 5: 63.00% » Diosa RM » 63.10% Diosa Ricemill
# Eastern Grain Ctr., Inc. P 63.00%
» KNC Ricernill » 63.00%
Lot 6: 63.00% » Diosa RM > 63.10% Diosa Ricemill
» Eastern Grain Ctr., Inc. P 63.07%
Lot 7: 63.00% Diosa Ricemill 63.00% Diosa Ricemfll




Lot 8: 63.00% Diosa Ricemill 63.00% Diosa Ricemill
: » RS Grains Milling Cir. P 63.00%
Lot 9; 63.00% > Masagana pore »63.01% Masagana Grains Center
o P RS Grains Milling Cir. »63.00%
Lot 10: 63.00% » Masagana GC »63.01% Masagana Grains Center
y ® RS Grains Milling Ctr. P 63.01%
Lot 11: 63.00% » Masagana GC »63.02% RS Grains & Milling Center
S RS Grains Milling Ctr. »63.02%
Lot 12: 63.00% » Masagana GC » 63.01% RS Grains & Milling Center
A B RS Grains Milling Ctr. »63.02% i .
Lot 13: 63.00% » Masagana GC > 63.01% RS Grains & Milling Center
Lot 14: 63.00% RS Grains Milling Center 63.00% RS Grains & Milling Center
’ Lucky Archer Grains & Lucky Archer Grains &
Liot15:53.00% Processing Center A, Processing Center
- 63.00% Lucky Archer Grains & Lucky Archer Grains &
bk 16, 63.00W Processing Center el Processing Center
L Lucky Archer Grains & , Lucky Archer Grains &
KoE17:88; Processing Center 63.00% Processing Center
3 Lucky Archer Grains & Lucky Archer Grains &
Lot 18: 63.00% Processing Center 63.00% Processing Cenler
10.b NFA ISABELA e » Lucky Archer GPC > 63.00% i fesTue T August 2,2019 August 13,2019 |  August 27,2019 September 14, 2019
e » Masagana GC P 63.01% .
; » Lucky ] 888 RM Corp. > 63.00%
Lot 20; 63.00% B Eastarn Grafn Ctr., Inc. »63.01% Eastern Grain Center, Inc.
) P Lucky | 888 RM Corp. P 63.00% :
Lot 21: 63.00% » Eastern Grain Ctr, inc. > 63.01% Eastern Grain Center, Inc,
. P Lucky ] 888 RM Corp. P 63.00%
Lot 22: 63.00% » Bastarn Grain Cir.. Bnc. »6301% Eastern Grain Center, Inc.
. P Lucky | 888 RM Corp. »63.00% ;
Lot 23: 63.00% » Eastern Grain Ctr,, Inc. »63.01% Eastern Grain Center, Inc.
P Lucky ] 888 RM Corp. P 63.00%
Lot 24: 63.00% B Eastern Grain Ctr,, Inc. P 63.00% Masagana Grains Center
B Masagana GC P 63.01%
Lot 25: 63.00% Lucky ) 888 Ricemill 63.00% Lucky ] 888 Ricemill
Corporation Carporation
) Lucky ] BBB Ricemill ; Lucky | 888 Ricemill
Lot 26: 63.00% Cor tion 63.00% Corporation
: Lucky | 888 Ricemill Lucky | 888 Ricemill
Eot 27: 05000 Corparation S0% Corporation
. Lucky | 868 Ricemill Lucky | 888 Ricemill
Lt 20:69. 005 Corporation s Corporation
P RC Lubong RM P> 63.51%
Lot 29: 63.00% P Masagana Commercial P 63.25% RC Lubong Ricemill
P St. Catherine MPC P 63.21%
» RC Lubong RM »63.15%
9 9
10.c NFA NUEVA VIZCAYA Lot 30: 63.00% » NV Alay Kapwa MPC » 63.25% NV Alay Kapwa MPC August 2, 201 August 13,201 August 27, 2019 September 14, 2019
P Marjophil Grains P 63.16%
Lot 31: 63.00% P Masagana Commercial P 63.00% Masagana Commercial
el > Marjophil Grains P 63.00% (Tie Breaking thru Draw Lots}




2019 SHIPPING SERVICES

FOR THE DISPERSAL OF
1,600 BAGS RICE FROM NFA
vali Bab Roger Valient :
11 | GONZAGA,CAGAYAN VIA 492,800.00 Rogw Vi ;;’:: rti:a[f yiyn 492,800.00 4 “M‘:t; g::f Babym | iy 26,2019 N/A August 16, 2019 August 23,2019
SAN VICENTE PORT, STA,
ANA, CAGAYAN TO NFA
WHSE., PALANAN, ISABELA
Supply and Delivery of 407 L. :
12 | Pirimiphos Methyl 50 EC for 976,800.00 ““’"““2"_’: dﬁ“’"’m D"'e“‘i,'lf:: d?“’ e kin Octaber 7, 2019 October 8, 2019
NFA RO2 Provinces ng
Lot 1: 2,500,000.00 B Proline Construction -#1,923,161.13 # Praline Construction
P Buildtek Construction »P2,246,281 17 » Buildtek Construction
3 | &9 cog 1“2:‘"“"“ Lot 2:2,500,00000 | W Proline Construction > P1.879,268.78 » Praline Construction October4,2019 | October 14,2019 | October28,2019 | Novembers,2019
ro} B Buildtek Construction > P2,161,78227 # Buildtek Construction
Lot 3: 1,230,000.00 ¥ Proline Construction | P122595400 #- Proline Construction
Hauling Services for the W ERNM Tricig » $73,127,180.00 SR s
14 Transfer of 500,000 Bags 79,127,180.00 October 4, 2019 October 14,2019 October 28,2019 November 5,2019
WMR to NFA NCR P Gokien thiunt Sy P No Bid Submitted Mnrksting
® Management & Agencies Inc.
SUPPLY & DELIVERY OF
ADDITIONAL
REQUIREMENTS OF 250,000 . ) )
10 | PCSBRAND NEW WOVEN 2,297,500.00 Pilosch 'gﬂr”‘“r’:;;“m“g 2.297,500.00 Phisek '2::‘5‘:;::"“3“‘3 November 13,2019 | November 13,2019 | November 13,2019
POLYPROPYLENE 50 KG- po P
CAPACITY RICE EMPTY
SACKS
15 |Procurement of Mist Polishing Services with Aroma Pandan Flavor
154 NFA-NCA Lot 1: 585,500.00 Ravilas Ricemill 591,000.00 Ravilas Ricemill
Lot 2: 585,500.00 E Ravilas Ricemill No Bid Submitted
Lot 3: 487,500.00 KNC Ricermnill 443,250.00 KNC Ricemill
Lot 4: 487,500.00 KNC Ricemill 443,250.00 KNC Ricemill
» KNC Ricemill P 443,250,00
15b NFA CAGAYAN Lat 5: 487,500.00 minbisnpéinge ST N 497 £00:00 KNC Ricemill
P KNC Ricemill > 443,25000
Lot 6: 487,500.00 b Lucky Archer GPC s 44 500,00 KNC Ricemill
Lot 7: 1,023,750.00 Masagana GC 1,034,250.00 Masagana GC
Lot 8: 853,125.00 Masagana GC 861,875.00 Masagana GC
Lot 9: 853,125.00 dela Cruz - Cadelina RM 861,875.00 dela Cruz - Cadelina RM
Lot 10:853,125.00 Alheed IAIl 861.875.00 Alheed 1411
Lot 11: 487,500.00 Lucky | 888 492,500.00 Lucky | 888
15.c NFA ISABELA Lot 12: 487,500.00 HR Pascua G&RM 492,500.00 HR Pascua GRRM




15.¢ NFA ISABELA Lot 12: 487,500.00 HR Pascua G&RM 492,500.00 HR Pascua G&RM
Lot 15: 487,500.00 HR Pascua G&RM 492,500.00 HR Pascua G&RM
November 22, 2019 N/A November 28,2019 | November 29,2019
Lat 16: 487,500.00 Eastern Grain Ctr. Inc. 492,500.00 Eastern Grain Ctr. Inc.
Lot 17: 487,500.00 RS Grains Milling Ctr. 492,500.00 RS Grains Milling Ctr.
Lot 18: 487,500.00 RS Grains Milling Ctr. 492,500.00 RS Grains Milling Ctr.
Lot 19: 487,500.00 Lucky Archer GPC 492,500.00 Lucky Archer GPC
Lot 20: 487,500.00 JGL Grains 492,500.00 JGL Grains
15.d NFA KALINGA
Lot 21: 487,500.00 JGL Grains 492,500.00 JGL Grains
Lot 22: 531,250.00 RC Lubong 73.8750.00 RC Lubong
156 |  NFANUEVAVIZCAYA
Lot 23: 531,250.00 Masagana Commercial 73.8,750.00 Masagana Commercial
Lot 24: 487,500.00 Alheed Al 492,500.00 Alheed IAII
15.f NFA QUIRINO
Lot 25: 487,500.00 Alheed 1Al 492,500.00 Alheed 1A1]
ADDITIONAL WORKS FOR
THE REPAIR AND RE- ; .
16 | ROOFINGOFTRIPLEX |LOt 1: 37683887 Proline Construction Lot1: 37683504 Proline Construction December 6, 2019 N/A December 12,2019 | December 13, 2019

WAREHOUSE AT SANTIAGO
CITY

Lot 2: 587,534,.39

Lot 2: 587,526.33

Certified Correct:

W

ANTONIO M. MACATO
BAC Chairperson

Nao

RO L. VALDEZ

Regional Manager 11/ HoPE




